
Monday Tuesday Wednesday Thursday Friday

7 8
School Spirit Day
(Wear Ferris Gear or 
Yellow and Green)

9
Hot Chocolate Day
(Share your favorite Hot 
Chocolate Recipe as a 
comment in your Lunch 
Classroom)

10
Cookie Exchange Day
(Share your favorite 
Cookie Recipe as a 
comment in your Lunch 
Classroom)
Hanukkah Begins

11
Movie Night
(Share your favorite 
Holiday Movie with a quote 
from it,  as a comment in 
your Lunch Classroom)

14
Holiday Card Day
(send a teacher an email, 
text/Holiday GIF to your 
BFF, or go “old school” and 
mail a card to a family 
member)

15
Holiday Music Day
(Post your favorite Holiday 
song on School Instagram)

16
Gingerbread and Candy 
Cane Day
(bake or enjoy your 
favorite holiday treats with 
your family-share in your 
lunch classroom)

17
Post a picture of your 
Holiday Decorations
(Show off your family, pets, 
or classroom. Post on 
School Instagram)

18
Holiday Pajama Day
(Wear your Holiday 
Pajamas to class, *must 
be school appropriate*)
Hanukkah Ends

21
Santa hat or Antlers Day
(Post on School Insta)

22
Holiday  Sweater Day
(Wear your Holiday 
themed sweater to class, 
*must be school 
appropriate*)

23
Ferris Holiday & 
Christmas Caroling
(Request a carol in class.  
Lunch Classrooms will be 
participating)
12:45 Dismissal

24
Christmas Eve
School Closed

25
Christmas
School Closed

*Kwanzaa begins on December 26th and ends on January 1st

Please upload screenshots 
of your class to the holiday  

album or email them to 
mpooler@jcboe.org)

Post to School 
Instagram 
@ferrishighschooljc


